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SCRUTINY REPORT

To:  Chair, Ladies and Gentlemen

Performance Report - Human Resources and Payroll

1.0 SUMMARY OF THE REPORT

1.1. In 2013 outcomes were judged as unsatisfactory, the HR Service overall was not 
considered value for money due to the proportion of HR officers per employee cohort. 
However, there was good practice within the service, such as Occupational Health 
and Safety performance.  To address the unsatisfactory performance a HR Review 
was instigated, following this the key issues for the service were identified. These fall 
under 4 themes: Culture and Leadership; Forward Planning and Work programming; 
Communication; and Training and Development. 

1.2.Following the WAO audit in March 2016 outcomes were judged as ‘Adequate’-with the 
summary in the report stating ‘The Council has made good progress in improving the 
services provided by its Human Resources (HR) function, but there remains scope to 
further develop arrangements for workforce planning and performance monitoring.’ 

1.3.Our ambition (as a Council) is to be top performing; sustainable and an authority with 
a good reputation. For 2016/17 the service’s ambition is to deliver the Managers 
Academy, and complete the desired outcomes in accordance with the department’s 
strategies. 

2.0 RECOMMENDATION(S)

2.1 The judgements and evaluations are noted and debated.
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3.0 INTRODUCTION AND BACKGROUND
National Context

3.1 All local authorities in Wales are required to secure continuous improvement in the 
exercise of their functions by identifying their own priorities for improvement. This legal 
requirement is set out in the Local Government Measure 2009.

Council Vision

3.2 To strengthen Merthyr Tydfil’s position as the regional centre for the Heads of the 
Valleys, and be a place to be proud of where:

a) People learn and develop skills to fulfil their ambitions

b) People live, work and have a safe healthy and fulfilled life

c) People visit, enjoy and return

Vision for Human Resources and Payroll

3.3 To help enable the successful implementation and delivery of the Corporate Plan, 
Strategy and Change programme through effective people support, advice and guidance

Strategy Outcomes

3.4
 All employees have an up to date job description and contract.

 CHRIS/HR 21 is used effectively as a time management system and employee 

database.

 The change programme is supported effectively.

 Employees are paid on time and receive the correct salary.

 Employee health is positive with necessary interventions effectively implemented.

 Business information is robust and used intelligently.

 HR & Payroll SLAs deliver an effective service to the customer

 Changes within the organisational job roles and structures are administered well



4.0 WHERE WE WERE

4.1 Key indicators 
Merthyr Tydfil
2013/14

Up to date job descriptions Not recorded
Correct employment contracts Not recorded
Employees using HR21 Not recorded
Employees with workplace stress Not recorded
Cases manage by HR past policy timeframe before 
completion 

Not recorded

SLA customers with high levels of satisfaction 96%
Employees  who had accidents 6%
Employees redeployed 34
Employees under risk of redundancy Not recorded

The HR Review identified that leadership within the HR Service was lacking. The HR 
culture was found to be dysfunctional with perception by some that there is a blame 
culture. The HR service is split over 2 sites which increases the barriers between teams. 

The HR Review found that the functional teams themselves communicated well, but 
between teams there was little or no communication. The lack of forward planning, and 
the Head of HR’s refusal to complete the Corporate Performance Management process 
robustly (e.g. self-evaluation) has contributed to the HR Service having no clear 
direction. 

Many of the HR officers are self-initiators of work, and motivate themselves to complete 
their work tasks. The absence of formal one to ones further isolated many team members 
from the team ethos, understanding of corporate issues and collective work 
programming.

5.0 WHERE WE ARE NOW

5.1 Key indicators
Merthyr Tydfil
2015/16

Up to date job descriptions held by HR 20%
Correct employment contracts 100%
Employees using HR21either themselves or through their 
managers

100%

Employees with workplace stress No data recoded
Cases manage by HR past policy timeframe before completion 
SLA customers with high levels of satisfaction 96%
Employees  who had accidents 6%
Employees redeployed 20 



Employees under risk of redundancy 1

The current position of outcomes are from the conclusion of the recent WAO inspection 
namely that The Council has strengthened the leadership of its HR function, is 
improving HR services and is getting better at communicating and engaging with staff 
and stakeholders.

The service started a programme in March 2016 in relation to centralisation of Job 
Descriptions and Employment Contracts. The service is working with managers to 
ensure that all employees Job Descriptions and Employment contracts are held on the 
EDM system. All new employees since 2010 have their documents held on EDM.

All staff are now on the HR21 system under their line manager. Not all staff are on the 
TA21 system as there may not be a business requirement for the staff to work patterns 
that require the ‘clock in and out’

The staff stress survey has been drafted and will be considered by CMT for distribution 
to staff in September 2016. This will be the first time that a survey of this sort has been 
undertaken by the authority. This survey will set the base line for continuing years and 
will be used as part of the employee assist programme for the future work plan.

A help desk system to manage case work and advice, to monitor advice time lines, and 
use as performance data was established in December 2015. This is still being utilised 
by the department and mangers can request data should they require it. The system 
has also been used to respond to FOI and DPA requests.

The table below sets out the actions undertaken to date:

Action Impact/outcome Progress made

Workforce development 
Strategy and HR & Payroll 
Strategy

Clear work programme 
aligned to the Corporate 
priorities

Strategies in place, delivery 
plans being developed and 
team meetings being used to 
deliver the targets 

Fortnightly case review 
meetings.
Operations team undertake 
weekly case reviews

Resolve issues quickly,
Consistency of advice
Peer support

These are useful as they 
enable the HR professionals 
to discuss solutions and 
share good practice. These 
are on-going

HR Customer Charter Customer knows what to 
expect from HR 
professionals

This is complete and 
published to all staff, 
including schools. This now 



needs to be reviewed
HR Service level  (schools 
and Leisure trust) 

HR understand the SLA 
needs through regular 
meetings and through 
satisfaction measures

SLA’s reviewed each year, 
continuous discussions as 
part of contract 
management.

HR Policy review and 
guidance notes

Clear policies, easy to use 
and gives confidence to 
teachers and governors 

Under way. Also creating 
guidance and check lists. 
The intranet will hold these 
policies and guidance

HR Policy and performance 
training for managers

Confident to manage people 
and use policies 

Training delivery has been 
completed. Evaluation is 
now underway for the next 
set of training to be rolled out

HR structure Fit for purpose service Now that HR and Legal are 
under one Head of Service, 
this is an opportunity to 
make further changes to 
strengthen joint working. 

HR helpdesk One point of contact for HR 
queries.
Audit of calls and advice, 
measures whether achieved 
required timelines

HR Officers now using the 
system to record cases they 
manage. 

HR embedded within change 
programme

There are clear roles for HR 
within the change 
programme from business 
inception, consultation, and 
redundancy management. 

New policy, guidance, 
processes are in place. HR 
Officers roles aligned to 
manage the programme. 

6.0 HOW DID WE GET HERE

Reference to Initiatives
(Full details in Appendix I)

6.1 Appointed new manager of HR

6.2 Reviewed the structure and capacity of staff to make better use of resources

6.3 Identified projects for future workforce development



7.0 WHERE WE WANT TO BE

7.1 Key indicator

Merthyr Tydfil
2016/17

Up to date job descriptions 100%
Correct employment contracts 100%
Employees using HR21 themselves o through their 
managers

100%

Employees with workplace stress Baseline data 
being 
collected in 
Jan 2017

Cases manage by HR past policy timeframe before 
completion 

100%

SLA customers with high levels of satisfaction 97%
Employees  who had accidents 5%
Employees redeployed 100%
Employees under risk of redundancy This cannot 

be controlled 
by HR as it is 
the service 
area that 
decides this.

7.2 We will continue working with the Corporate Leadership team and schools to ensure HR 
is delivering what is needed. This enables us to understand issues early and resolve 
them.

7.3 A leadership programme (The Managers Academy) has been developed and will be 
implemented in November and offered to top tier of leaders comprising of full day 
workshops involving interactive sessions. The programme is designed so that participants 
experience much more than tools and techniques for leadership and change.  It asks 
participants to examine the habits, beliefs, and attitudes that drive their behaviour.  It 
encourages participants to look at the range of opportunities that exist in work situations, 
so that they can challenge and reframe their thinking in a way that increases both 
personal impact and organisational performance.  

7.4 Participants will be able to define what they want to achieve from the programme using a 
variety of diagnostic tools.  These personal objectives will be met through a diverse range 
of development activities including workshops, one-to-one coaching and work-based 
learning.  Potential benefits of completing the programme include:

• Greater self awareness translating into personal growth and confidence



• Enhanced ability to work with a wide range of people
• Improved flexibility and decision making in delivering innovative solutions 

to difficult problems
• Sharper focus on delivering results
• Stronger presence and personal impact on team performance
• Increased leadership capacity

7.5 The Council has partnered with the T2 Training Group funded through the Welsh 
Government to deliver the Higher Apprenticeship in Management programme. This 
programme will enhance core management capabilities for those in a senior management 
role. Managers would be expected to play an integral role in setting and supporting the 
Council’s objectives through a wide range of functions, such as, completing reviews of 
policies and procedures, managing a team, providing leadership within their area of 
responsibility and encouraging staff to take responsibility for their own development. The 
programme is delivered through the workplace, with evidence gathered through real work 
activities. 

7.6 The Essential Skills of literacy, numeracy and ICT are also integrated into the work 
produced and are recognised and accredited. On completion of the framework, the 
candidate will receive the following qualifications/certificates:

 ILM NVQ Diploma in Management and Leadership (53 credits)
 OCR Level 5 Diploma in Management and Leadership ( 40 credits)
 Essential Application of Number Skills Level 2, Essential Communication Skills 

Level 2 and Essential Digital Literacy Skills Level 2.

7.9 Through this training it is a priority of the service to get to a point where managers are 
confident to manage people issues through their own effective leadership, using policies 
that are clear and easy to use, and where potential issues are resolved quickly before 
they become a complex case.

8.0 WHAT WE NEED TO DO NEXT

New initiatives

8.1 Update HR21 and TA21 to integrate both systems so that the systems are easier for 
managers to use.

8.2 Provide updates on the Managers Training Academy and Mangers Apprenticeship 
Programme to CMT.

8.3 Undertake a stress survey with all staff

8.4 Collect all staff data via the HR21 system for the Strategic Equality Plan 2016-2020



9.0 PREPARATION FOR THE WELLBEING DUTY

9.1 The Social Services and Wellbeing (SSWB) Act became law in Wales on 01 May 2014. 
The Act changes the way people’s needs are assessed and the way services are 
delivered – people will have more of a say in the care and support they receive. The Act 
also promotes a range of help available within the community to reduce the need for 
formal, planned support. 

9.2 The Wellbeing of Future Generations (WFG) Act became law in Wales on 29 April 2015. 
The Act places a wellbeing duty on public bodies to adopt the sustainable development 
principal (5 ways of working) to secure improvements in the social, economic, 
environmental and cultural wellbeing of Wales.

9.3 There may be modules on the All Wales academy that can be rolled out as part of the 
staff training in order to maximise staff development and opportunities.

9.4 Workforce development will be undertaken in accordance with the five ways of working. 

GARETH CHAPMAN
CHIEF EXECUTIVE

COUNCILLOR PHIL WILLIAMS
CABINET MEMBER FOR GOVERNANCE 

AND CORPORATE SERVICES
Does the report contain any issues that may 
affect the Council’s Constitution? NO


